
TOWNSHIP OF ABERDEEN
SUMMARY OF BIDS

FOR: Road Materials for Maintenance & Repair   DATE: Thursday, September 14, 2023 @ 11:30 a.m.

Stavola Construction
Materials, Inc
175 Drift Road

Tinton Falls, NJ  07724

Bid Bond YES
Non-Collusion YES
Affirmative Action YES
Bid Proposal YES
Cert of Ownership YES

MILEAGE *51 Miles @ .61= $31.11
15 Miles @ .61= $9.15 Second Year Option

Ite
m

Description
Estimated
Quantity

Unit Price Price with Miles Unit Price Price with Miles Price with Miles

1.

HMA (Mix 9.5m64)
Surface Course
Hauled by DPW 1200 Tons $80.00 $96,000.00 $82.50 $99,000.00

2.

HMA (Mix 19M64)
Base Course
Hauled by DPW 600 Tons $79.00 $47,400.00 $81.50 $48,900.00

3.

High Performance Cold 
Mix (Cold Patch) Hauled 
by DPW       10 Pallets No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4.
¾” Broken Stone (Quarry 
Blend) Hauled by DPW 100 Tons $18.50 $1,850.00 $20.50 $2,050.00

5.
¾ Broken Stone (Clean 

Stone) Hauled by DPW 100 Tons $22.50 $2,250.00 $24.50 $2,450.00

6.

2-1/2”  Broken Stone 
(Coarse Aggregate) 
Hauled by DPW 100 Tons     $22.50 $2,250.00 $24.50 $2,450.00

ALTERNATES- 
DELIVERY 
INCLUDED Unit Price Extended Price Extended Price

4A
.

¾” Broken Stone (Quarry 
Blend) F.O.B. from Plant 
to DPW Yard 500 Tons $27.25 $13,625.00 $29.25 $14,625.00

5A
.

2-1/2” Broken Stone 
(Clean Stone) F.O.B. 
from Plant to DPW Yard 500 Tons $29.75 $14,875.00 $31.75 $15,875.00

6A
.

2-1/2” Broken Stone 
(Coarse Aggregate) F.O.B
from Plant to DPW Yard 100 Tons $29.75 $2,975.00 $31.75 $3,175.00



TOWNSHIP OF ABERDEEN
SUMMARY OF BIDS

FOR: Road Materials for Maintenance & Repair   DATE: Thursday, September 14, 2023 @ 11:30 a.m.

Trap Rock Industries
P.O. Box 419

Kingston, NJ  08528

Bid Bond YES
Non-Collusion YES
Affirmative Action YES
Bid Proposal YES
Cert of Ownership YES

MILEAGE *48 Miles @ .61 = $29.28
     21 Miles @ .61 = $12.81 Second Year Option

Item Description
Estimated
Quantity

Unit Price Price with Miles Unit Price Price with Miles

1.

HMA (Mix 9.5m64)
Surface Course
Hauled by DPW 1200 Tons $80.00 $96,000.00 $81.00 $97,200.00

2.

HMA (Mix 19M64)
Base Course
Hauled by DPW 600 Tons $78.00 $46,800.00 $79.00 $47,400.00

3.

High Performance Cold 
Mix (Cold Patch) Hauled 
by DPW   10 Pallets No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4.
¾” Broken Stone (Quarry 
Blend) Hauled by DPW 100 Tons $20.75 $2,075.00 $21.75 $2,175.00

5.
¾” Broken Stone (Clean 
Stone) Hauled by DPW 100 Tons $26.75 $2,675.00  $27.75 $2,725.00

6.

2-1/2” Broken Stone 
(Coarse Aggregate) 
Hauled by DPW 100 Tons No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

ALTERNATES- 
DELIVERY 
INCLUDED Unit Price Extended Price

4A.

¾” Broken Stone (Quarry 
Blend) F.O.B. from Plant 
to DPW Yard 500 Tons $28.25 $14,125.00 $29.25 $14,625.00

5A.

2-1/2” Broken Stone 
(Clean Stone) F.O.B. 
from Plant to DPW Yard 500 Tons $34.25 $17,125.00 $35.25 $17,625.00

6A.

2-1/2” Broken Stone 
(Coarse Aggregate) F.O.B
from Plant to DPW Yard 100 Tons No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid






