
FOR: Water Materials for Maintenance & Repair DATE: Tuesday, November 21, 2023 @ 11:00 am

Core & Main
61 Gross Avenue
Edison, NJ  08837

year 2

Bid Bond YES
Non-Collusion YES
Affirmative Action YES
Bid Proposal YES
Cert of Ownership YES

ITEM NO: DESCRIPTION QUANITY

1 6" CLDI pipe 20 LF $31.00 $620.00
2 8" CLDI pipe 20 LF $41.50 $830.00
3 6" Mueller 2360 gate valve 1 $1,100.00 $1,100.00
4 8" Mueller 2360 gate valve 1 $1,744.00 $1,744.00
5 5' bury Mueller SC250 fire hydrant 1 $4,350.00 $4,350.00
6 4.5' bury MSC250 fire hydrant 1 $4,000.00 $4,000.00
7 4'bury  Mueller SC250 fire hydrant 1 $4,275.00 $4,275.00
8 5 1/4 Mueller A-301 Break-away Kit 1 $375.00 $375.00
9 4 1/2 Mueller A-300 Break-away Kit 1 $330.00 $330.00

10 8x6 MJ hyrant tee 1 $405.00 $405.00
11 8" MJ tee 1 $350.00 $350.00
12 8" solid sleeve 1 $186.75 $186.75
13 8" MJ 90* bend 1 $240.00 $240.00
14 8" MJ 45* bend 1 $190.00 $190.00
15 8" MJ 22.5* bend 1 $186.75 $186.75
16 8" Mega lug & kit 1 $80.00 $80.00
17 6x6 MJ hydrant tee 1 $272.00 $272.00
18 6" hydrant tee 1 $235.00 $235.00
19 6" MJ solid sleeve 1 $143.00 $143.00
20 6" MJ 90* bend 1 $164.00 $164.00
21 6" MJ 45* bend 1 $134.00 $134.00
22 6" MJ 22.5* bend 1 $122.00 $122.00
23 6" Mega lug & kit 1 $57.75 $57.75
24 5/8" Sensus TRPL water meter 1 $155.00 $155.00
25 5/8x3/4 Sensus TRPL water meter 1 $155.00 $155.00
26 1" Sensus water meter 1 $235.00 $235.00
27 2" Sensus water meter 1 $1,595.00 $1,595.00
28 3" Sensus water meter 1 $2,025.00 $2,025.00

TOWNSHIP OF ABERDEEN

SUMMARY OF BIDS

UNIT PRICE              TOTAL



29 4" Sensus water meter 1 $3,515.00 $3,515.00
30 6" Sensus water meter 1 $6,060.00 $6,060.00
31 Sensus AMI transmitter 1 $175.00 $175.00
32 Sensus TRPL pigtail 1 $0.25 $0.25
33 4' 2PC road box w/cover 1 $244.00 $244.00
34 1" road box riser 1 $22.00 $22.00
35 2" road box riser 1 $30.00 $30.00
36 3" road box riser 1 $37.00 $37.00
37 4" road box riser 1 $53.00 $53.00
38 4' Mueller H-10314 curb box 1 $66.00 $66.00
39 18" Mueller H10816 meter pit cvr. 1 $110.00 $110.00
40 20" Mueller H10816 meter pit cvr. 1 $132.00 $132.00
41 18x36 Mueller S1836 meter pit 1 $117.00 $117.00
42 20x36 Mueller S2036 meter pit 1 $120.00 $120.00
43 18"x36" Mueller EZ setter with lid 1 $227.00 $227.00
44 20"x36" Mueller EZ setter with lid 1 $252.00 $252.00
45 5/8 McD #37 meter setter 1 $184.00 $184.00
46 5/8x3/4 McD #37 meter setter 1 $215.00 $215.00
47 1" McD #37 meter setter 1 $425.00 $425.00
48 5/8 McD #30 meter setter 1 $390.00 $390.00
49 5/8x3/4 McD #30 meter setter 1 $240.00 $240.00
50 1" McD #30 meter setter 1 $455.00 $455.00
51 3/4 Mueller #1500 corporation 1 $42.00 $42.00
52 1" Mueller #1500 corporation 1 $62.00 $62.00
53 3/4 curb stop (flare) 1 $90.00 $90.00
54 3/4 curb stop (compression) 1 $88.00 $88.00
55 1" curb stop (flare) 1 $125.00 $125.00
56 1" curb stop (compression) 1 $135.00 $135.00
57 3/4 K copper tubbing 1 $8.75 $8.75
58 1 K copper tubbing 1 $9.75 $9.75
59 8x1 2-bolt brass saddle 1 $169.00 $169.00
60 8x3/4 2-bolt brass saddle 1 $169.00 $169.00
61 6x1 2-bolt brass saddle 1 $130.00 $130.00
62 6x3/4 2-bolt brass saddle 1 $130.00 $130.00
63 8x12 full circle repair clamp 1 $204.00 $204.00
64 8x20 full circle repair clamp 1 $330.00 $330.00
65 6x12 full circle repair clamp 1 $173.00 $173.00
66 6x20 full circle repair clamp 1 $288.00 $288.00
67 6" Hymax Coupling 1 $311.00 $311.00
68 8" Hymax Coupling 1 $352.00 $352.00
69 1" swivel 90* bend 1 $52.50 $52.50
70 1" swivel 45* bend 1 $45.00 $45.00
71 3/4 swivel 90* bend 1 $37.00 $37.00
72 3/4 swivel 45* bend 1 $33.00 $33.00
73 1" compression coupling w/lock 1 $31.25 $31.25
74 3/4 compression coupling w/lock 1 $27.25 $27.25

TOTAL $39,289.50 $40,667.00



FOR: Water Materials for Maintenance & Repair DATE: Tuesday, November 21, 2023 @ 11:00am

Ferguson Waterworks
507 Oak Glen Rd
Howell, NJ 07731

Bid Bond YES
Non-Collusion YES
Affirmative Action YES
Bid Proposal YES
Cert of Ownership YES

ITEM NO: DESCRIPTION QUANITY

1 6" CLDI pipe 18 LF $37.00 $666.00
2 8" CLDI pipe 18 LF $44.00 $798.00
3 6" Mueller 2360 gate valve 1 $1,045.00 $1,045.00
4 8" Mueller 2360 gate valve 1 $1,660.00 $1,660.00
5 5' bury Mueller SC250 fire hydrant 1 $3,700.00 $3,700.00
6 4.5' bury MSC250 fire hydrant 1 $3,650.00 $3,650.00
7 4'bury  Mueller SC250 fire hydrant 1 $3,550.00 $3,550.00
8 5 1/4 Mueller A-301 Break-away Kit 1 $330.00 $330.00
9 4 1/2 Mueller A-300 Break-away Kit 1 $290.00 $290.00

10 8x6 MJ hyrant tee 1 $360.00 $360.00
11 8" MJ tee 1 $318.00 $318.00
12 8" solid sleeve 1 $170.00 $170.00
13 8" MJ 90* bend 1 $225.00 $225.00
14 8" MJ 45* bend 1 $185.00 $185.00
15 8" MJ 22.5* bend 1 $185.00 $185.00
16 8" Mega lug & kit 1 $77.00 $77.00
17 6x6 MJ hydrant tee 1 $252.00 $252.00
18 6" hydrant tee 1 $252.00 $252.00
19 6" MJ solid sleeve 1 $150.00 $150.00
20 6" MJ 90* bend 1 $155.00 $155.00
21 6" MJ 45* bend 1 $130.00 $130.00
22 6" MJ 22.5* bend 1 $130.00 $130.00
23 6" Mega lug & kit 1 $60.00 $60.00
24 5/8" Sensus TRPL water meter 1 NO BID NO BID
25 5/8x3/4 Sensus TRPL water meter 1 NO BID NO BID
26 1" Sensus water meter 1 NO BID NO BID
27 2" Sensus water meter 1 NO BID NO BID
28 3" Sensus water meter 1 NO BID NO BID

TOWNSHIP OF ABERDEEN

SUMMARY OF BIDS

year 2

UNIT PRICE              TOTAL



29 4" Sensus water meter 1 NO BID NO BID
30 6" Sensus water meter 1 NO BID NO BID
31 Sensus AMI transmitter 1 NO BID NO BID
32 Sensus TRPL pigtail 1 NO BID NO BID
33 4' 2PC road box w/cover 1 $265.00 $265.00
34 1" road box riser 1 $16.00 $16.00
35 2" road box riser 1 $19.00 $19.00
36 3" road box riser 1 $36.00 $36.00
37 4" road box riser 1 $49.00 $49.00
38 4' Mueller H-10314 curb box 1 $65.00 $65.00
39 18" Mueller H10816 meter pit cvr. 1 $94.00 $94.00
40 20" Mueller H10816 meter pit cvr. 1 $137.00 $137.00
41 18x36 Mueller S1836 meter pit 1 $195.00 $195.00
42 20x36 Mueller S2036 meter pit 1 $241.00 $241.00
43 18"x36" Mueller EZ setter with lid 1 $795.00 $620.00
44 20"x36" Mueller EZ setter with lid 1 $941.00 $941.00
45 5/8 McD #37 meter setter 1 $150.00 $150.00
46 5/8x3/4 McD #37 meter setter 1 $160.00 $160.00
47 1" McD #37 meter setter 1 $275.00 $275.00
48 5/8 McD #30 meter setter 1 $141.00 $141.00
49 5/8x3/4 McD #30 meter setter 1 $132.00 $132.00
50 1" McD #30 meter setter 1 $230.00 $230.00
51 3/4 Mueller #1500 corporation 1 $53.00 $53.00
52 1" Mueller #1500 corporation 1 $83.00 $83.00
53 3/4 curb stop (flare) 1 $120.00 $120.00
54 3/4 curb stop (compression) 1 $109.00 $109.00
55 1" curb stop (flare) 1 $175.00 $175.00
56 1" curb stop (compression) 1 $180.00 $180.00
57 3/4 K copper tubbing 1 $6.00 $6.00 ft each
58 1 K copper tubbing 1 $7.75 $7.75 ft each
59 8x1 2-bolt brass saddle 1 $130.00 $130.00
60 8x3/4 2-bolt brass saddle 1 $130.00 $130.00
61 6x1 2-bolt brass saddle 1 $105.00 $105.00
62 6x3/4 2-bolt brass saddle 1 $105.00 $105.00
63 8x12 full circle repair clamp 1 $141.00 $141.00
64 8x20 full circle repair clamp 1 $230.00 $230.00
65 6x12 full circle repair clamp 1 $118.00 $118.00
66 6x20 full circle repair clamp 1 $208.00 $208.00
67 6" Hymax Coupling 1 $299.00 $299.00
68 8" Hymax Coupling 1 $339.00 $339.00
69 1" swivel 90* bend 1 $65.00 $65.00
70 1" swivel 45* bend 1 $74.00 $74.00
71 3/4 swivel 90* bend 1 $57.00 $57.00
72 3/4 swivel 45* bend 1 $56.00 $56.00
73 1" compression coupling w/lock 1 $35.00 $35.00
74 3/4 compression coupling w/lock 1 $33.00 $33.00

TOTAL $23,754.75 $24,962.75


	coremainyr2
	furgusonyr2



