
FOR: Water Materials for Maintenance & Repair DATE: Thursday, November 13, 2025 @ 10:30am

Core & Main
61 Gross Avenue
Edison, NJ  08837

Bid Bond YES
Non-Collusion YES
Affirmative Action YES
Bid Proposal YES
Cert of Ownership YES

ITEM NO: DESCRIPTION QUANITY

1 6" CLDI pipe 20 LF $30.45 $609.00
2 8" CLDI pipe 20 LF $42.95 $859.00
3 6" Mueller 2360 gate valve 1 $1,175.00 $1,175.00
4 8" Mueller 2360 gate valve 1 $1,865.00 $1,865.00
5 5' bury Mueller SC250 fire hydrant 1 $4,250.00 $4,250.00
6 4.5' bury MSC250 fire hydrant 1 $4,225.00 $4,225.00
7 4'bury  Mueller SC250 fire hydrant 1 $4,200.00 $4,200.00
8 5 1/4 Mueller A-301 Break-away Kit 1 $475.00 $475.00
9 4 1/2 Mueller A-300 Break-away Kit 1 $450.00 $450.00

10 8x6 MJ hyrant tee 1 $415.00 $415.00
11 8" MJ tee 1 $357.00 $357.00
12 8" solid sleeve 1 $192.00 $192.00
13 8" MJ 90* bend 1 $244.00 $244.00
14 8" MJ 45* bend 1 $195.00 $195.00
15 8" MJ 22.5* bend 1 $192.00 $192.00
16 8" Mega lug & kit 1 $85.00 $85.00
17 6x6 MJ hydrant tee 1 $278.00 $278.00
18 6" hydrant tee 1 $241.00 $241.00
19 6" MJ solid sleeve 1 $147.00 $147.00
20 6" MJ 90* bend 1 $168.00 $168.00
21 6" MJ 45* bend 1 $139.00 $139.00
22 6" MJ 22.5* bend 1 $125.00 $125.00
23 6" Mega lug & kit 1 $63.00 $63.00
24 5/8" Sensus TRPL water meter 1 $175.00 $175.00
25 5/8x3/4 Sensus TRPL water meter 1 $175.00 $175.00
26 1" Sensus water meter 1 $270.00 $270.00
27 2" Sensus water meter 1 $1,725.00 $1,725.00
28 3" Sensus water meter 1 $2,180.00 $2,180.00

TOWNSHIP OF ABERDEEN

SUMMARY OF BIDS

year 1

UNIT PRICE              TOTAL



29 4" Sensus water meter 1 $3,786.00 $3,786.00
30 6" Sensus water meter 1 $6,540.00 $6,540.00
31 Sensus AMI transmitter 1 $180.00 $180.00
32 Sensus TRPL pigtail 1 $0.25 $0.25
33 4' 2PC road box w/cover 1 $250.00 $250.00
34 1" road box riser 1 $22.00 $22.00
35 2" road box riser 1 $30.00 $30.00
36 3" road box riser 1 $37.00 $37.00
37 4" road box riser 1 $53.00 $53.00
38 4' Mueller H-10314 curb box 1 $66.00 $66.00
39 18" Mueller H10816 meter pit cvr. 1 $110.00 $110.00
40 20" Mueller H10816 meter pit cvr. 1 $132.00 $132.00
41 18x36 Mueller S1836 meter pit 1 $115.00 $115.00
42 20x36 Mueller S2036 meter pit 1 $120.00 $120.00
43 18"x36" Mueller EZ setter with lid 1 NO BID NO BID
44 20"x36" Mueller EZ setter with lid 1 NO BID NO BID
45 5/8 McD #37 meter setter 1 $195.00 $195.00
46 5/8x3/4 McD #37 meter setter 1 $195.00 $195.00
47 1" McD #37 meter setter 1 $385.00 $385.00
48 5/8 McD #30 meter setter 1 $344.00 $344.00
49 5/8x3/4 McD #30 meter setter 1 $357.00 $357.00
50 1" McD #30 meter setter 1 $400.00 $400.00
51 3/4 Mueller #1500 corporation 1 $50.00 $50.00
52 1" Mueller #1500 corporation 1 $75.00 $75.00
53 3/4 curb stop (flare) 1 $90.00 $90.00
54 3/4 curb stop (compression) 1 $95.00 $95.00
55 1" curb stop (flare) 1 $133.00 $133.00
56 1" curb stop (compression) 1 $142.00 $142.00
57 BLANK BLANK BLANK BLANK
58 3/4 K copper tubbing 1 $9.85 $985.00 ft each
59 1 K copper tubbing 1 $13.00 $1,300.00 ft each
60 8x1 2-bolt brass saddle 1 $169.00 $169.00
61 8x3/4 2-bolt brass saddle 1 $169.00 $169.00
62 6x1 2-bolt brass saddle 1 $136.00 $136.00
63 6x3/4 2-bolt brass saddle 1 $136.00 $136.00
64 8x12 full circle repair clamp 1 $146.00 $146.00
65 8x20 full circle repair clamp 1 $240.00 $240.00
66 6x12 full circle repair clamp 1 $136.00 $136.00
67 6x20 full circle repair clamp 1 $220.00 $220.00
68 6" Hymax Coupling 1 $365.00 $365.00
69 8" Hymax Coupling 1 $412.00 $412.00
70 1" swivel 90* bend 1 $54.00 $54.00
71 1" swivel 45* bend 1 $46.00 $46.00
72 3/4 swivel 90* bend 1 $38.00 $38.00
73 3/4 swivel 45* bend 1 $35.00 $35.00
74 1" compression coupling w/lock 1 $30.00 $30.00
75 3/4 compression coupling w/lock 1 $26.00 $26.00

TOTAL $40,362.50 $44,019.25



FOR: Water Materials for Maintenance & Repair DATE: Tuesday, November 21, 2023 @ 11:00 am

Core & Main
61 Gross Avenue
Edison, NJ  08837

year 2

Bid Bond YES
Non-Collusion YES
Affirmative Action YES
Bid Proposal YES
Cert of Ownership YES

ITEM NO: DESCRIPTION QUANITY

1 6" CLDI pipe 20 LF $33.07 $661.40
2 8" CLDI pipe 20 LF $46.05 $933.00
3 6" Mueller 2360 gate valve 1 $1,200.00 $1,200.00
4 8" Mueller 2360 gate valve 1 $1,925.00 $1,925.00
5 5' bury Mueller SC250 fire hydrant 1 $4,400.00 $4,400.00
6 4.5' bury MSC250 fire hydrant 1 $4,350.00 $4,350.00
7 4'bury  Mueller SC250 fire hydrant 1 $4,300.00 $4,300.00
8 5 1/4 Mueller A-301 Break-away Kit 1 $575.00 $575.00
9 4 1/2 Mueller A-300 Break-away Kit 1 $535.00 $535.00

10 8x6 MJ hyrant tee 1 $423.00 $423.00
11 8" MJ tee 1 $365.00 $365.00
12 8" solid sleeve 1 $195.00 $195.00
13 8" MJ 90* bend 1 $249.00 $249.00
14 8" MJ 45* bend 1 $199.00 $199.00
15 8" MJ 22.5* bend 1 $195.00 $195.00
16 8" Mega lug & kit 1 $90.00 $90.00
17 6x6 MJ hydrant tee 1 $285.00 $285.00
18 6" hydrant tee 1 $246.00 $246.00
19 6" MJ solid sleeve 1 $150.00 $150.00
20 6" MJ 90* bend 1 $172.00 $172.00
21 6" MJ 45* bend 1 $140.00 $140.00
22 6" MJ 22.5* bend 1 $130.00 $130.00
23 6" Mega lug & kit 1 $67.00 $67.00
24 5/8" Sensus TRPL water meter 1 $185.00 $185.00
25 5/8x3/4 Sensus TRPL water meter 1 $185.00 $185.00
26 1" Sensus water meter 1 $288.00 $288.00
27 2" Sensus water meter 1 $1,855.00 $1,855.00
28 3" Sensus water meter 1 $2,350.00 $2,350.00

TOWNSHIP OF ABERDEEN

SUMMARY OF BIDS

UNIT PRICE              TOTAL



29 4" Sensus water meter 1 $4,080.00 $4,080.00
30 6" Sensus water meter 1 $7,044.00 $7,044.00
31 Sensus AMI transmitter 1 $200.00 $200.00
32 Sensus TRPL pigtail 1 $0.27 $0.27
33 4' 2PC road box w/cover 1 $255.00 $255.00
34 1" road box riser 1 $24.00 $24.00
35 2" road box riser 1 $32.00 $32.00
36 3" road box riser 1 $39.00 $39.00
37 4" road box riser 1 $57.00 $57.00
38 4' Mueller H-10314 curb box 1 $66.00 $66.00
39 18" Mueller H10816 meter pit cvr. 1 $115.00 $115.00
40 20" Mueller H10816 meter pit cvr. 1 $135.00 $135.00
41 18x36 Mueller S1836 meter pit 1 $120.00 $120.00
42 20x36 Mueller S2036 meter pit 1 $125.00 $125.00
43 18"x36" Mueller EZ setter with lid 1 NO BID NO BID
44 20"x36" Mueller EZ setter with lid 1 NO BID NO BID
45 5/8 McD #37 meter setter 1 $200.00 $200.00
46 5/8x3/4 McD #37 meter setter 1 $200.00 $200.00
47 1" McD #37 meter setter 1 $395.00 $395.00
48 5/8 McD #30 meter setter 1 $355.00 $355.00
49 5/8x3/4 McD #30 meter setter 1 $367.00 $367.00
50 1" McD #30 meter setter 1 $412.00 $412.00
51 3/4 Mueller #1500 corporation 1 $53.00 $53.00
52 1" Mueller #1500 corporation 1 $80.00 $80.00
53 3/4 curb stop (flare) 1 $100.00 $100.00
54 3/4 curb stop (compression) 1 $100.00 $100.00
55 1" curb stop (flare) 1 $135.00 $135.00
56 1" curb stop (compression) 1 $144.00 $144.00
57 3/4 K copper tubbing 1 $10.25 $10.25
58 1 K copper tubbing 1 $13.95 $13.95
59 8x1 2-bolt brass saddle 1 $173.00 $173.00
60 8x3/4 2-bolt brass saddle 1 $173.00 $173.00
61 6x1 2-bolt brass saddle 1 $140.00 $140.00
62 6x3/4 2-bolt brass saddle 1 $140.00 $140.00
63 8x12 full circle repair clamp 1 $145.00 $145.00
64 8x20 full circle repair clamp 1 $239.00 $239.00
65 6x12 full circle repair clamp 1 $135.00 $135.00
66 6x20 full circle repair clamp 1 $220.00 $220.00
67 6" Hymax Coupling 1 $373.00 $373.00
68 8" Hymax Coupling 1 $421.00 $421.00
69 1" swivel 90* bend 1 $55.00 $55.00
70 1" swivel 45* bend 1 $48.00 $48.00
71 3/4 swivel 90* bend 1 $39.00 $39.00
72 3/4 swivel 45* bend 1 $35.00 $35.00
73 1" compression coupling w/lock 1 $31.00 $31.00
74 3/4 compression coupling w/lock 1 $27.00 $27.00

TOTAL $42,384.59 $43,899.87
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