RESOLUTION NO. 2016-110

WHEREAS, pursuant to provisions of the Local Public contracts Law, N.J.S.A. 40A:11-
1 et seq. Specifications and bid proposals were prepared and duly advertised by the Township of
Aberdeen for Department of Public Works Materials for Maintenance and Repairs; and

WHEREAS, bids were received by the Qualified Purchasing Agent on August 25, 2016
for the aforesaid project; and

WHEREAS, HD Water Works Supply of Edison, NJ was the lowest responsive and
responsible bidder for items 8-9, 18, 24-39, 41, 43-51, 56-57, 60-75; Water Works Supply Co.,
Inc. of Pompton Plains, NJ was the lowest responsive and responsible bidder for items 1-7, 10-
17, 19-23, 40, 42, 52-55, 58-59.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Township Council of the Township
of Aberdeen that the Department of Public Works Materials for Maintenance and Repairs
Contract be awarded to HD Water Works Supply of Edison, NJ for items 8-9, 18, 24-39, 41, 43-
51, 56-57, 60-75 and Water Works Supply Co., Inc. of Pompton Plains, NJ for items 1-7, 10-17,
19-23, 40, 42, 52-55, 58-59.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that this resolution is subject to the Township
Manager’s certification of availability of Township of Aberdeen funds.



TOWNSHIP OF ABERDEEN
SUMMARY OF BIDS
FOR: Water Materials for Maintenance & Repair DATE:Thursday, August 25, 2016 @ 10:00am

HD Waterworks Supply Water Works Supply Co., Inc.

61 Gross Avenue 660 State Highway 23
Edison, NJ 08837 P.O. Box 306
Pompton Plains, NJ 07444

Bid Bond yes yes

Non-Collusion yes yes

Affirmative Action yes yes

Bid Proposal yes yes

Cert of Ownership yes yes
TEM NC DESCRIPTION QUANITY UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
1 6" CLDI pipe 18 LF 15.29 14.98
2 8" CLDI pipe 18 LF 21.61 21.18
3 6" M2360 gate valve 1 615.00 548.54
4 8" M2360 gate valve 1 950.00 873.62
5 5' MSC250 fire hydrant 1 2,495.00 2,250.83
[ 4.5 MSC250 fire hydrant 1 2,450.00 2,200.85
7 4' MSC250 fire hydrant 1 2.400.00 2,150.99
8 5 1/4 M A-301 Break-away Kit 1 160.00 174.55
9 4 1/2 M A-300 Break-away Kit 1 160.00 174.55
10 8x6 MJ hyrant tee wiret 1 220.00 217.76
11 8" MJ tee wiret 1 228.00 225.69
12 8" solid sleeve wiret 1 121.00 119.69
13 8" MJ 90* bend wiret 1 155.00 153.59
14 8" MJ 45 bend wiret 1 124.00 122.58
15 8" MJ 22.5* bend wiret 1 121.00 119.69
16 8" Mega lug & kit 1 49.00 46.44
17 6x6 MJ hydrant tee w/ret 1 176.00 174.49
18 6" MJ tee wiret 1 1563.00 174.49
19 8" MJ solid sleeve wirat 1 93.00 91.58
20 8" MJ 90* bend wiret 1 106.00 104.56
21 6" MJ 45" bend wiret 1 87.50 86.53
22 8" MJ 22.5 bend wiret 1 80.00 78.60
23 8" Mega lug & kit 1 36.00 32.64
24 5/8" Sensus TRPL meter 1 140.00 No Bid
25 5/8x3/4 Sensus TRPL meter 1 140.00 No Bid
26 1" Sensus TRPL meter 1 185.00 No Bid
27 2" Sensus TRPL meter 1 690.00 No Bid
28 3" Sensus TRPL meter 1 1725.00 No Bid
29 4" Sensus TRPL meter 1 3000.00 No Bid
30 6" Sensus TRPL meter 1 5100.00 No Bid
31 Sensus MXU transmitter 1 14500 No Bid
32 3M Scotchiock UY2 connectors 1 0.27 No Bid
33 MXU Batteries 1 25.00 No Bid
34 Sensus SR TRPL register 1 66.00 No Bid
35 Sensus TRPL pigtall 1 14,00 No Bid
38 4' 2PC road box w/cover 1 115.00 117.00
37 1" road box riser 1 9.25 9.72
38 2" road box riser 1 13.75 15.08
39 3" road box riser 1 21.25 21,94
40 4" road box riser 1 27.50 26.54
44 4' Mueller H-10314 curb box 1 35.00 42.00
42 18" Mueller H10816 meter pit 1 85.00 49,49
43 20" Mueller H10816 meter pit 1 75.00 78.22
44 18x38 Musller 31838 meter pit 1 78.00 77.85
45 20x38 Musller 82036 meter pit 1 92.00 83.78
46 5/8 McD #37 meter sefter 1 87.50 No Bid
47 5/8x3/4 McD #37 meter setter 1 87.50 No Bid
48 1" MoD #37 meter selter 1 195.00 No Bid
45 5/8 McD #30 meler satler 1 107.50 No Bid
50 S/8x34 McD #30 meter selter 1 107.50 No Bid
51 1" McD #30 meter setter 1 203.00 No Bid
52 3/4 Mueller #1500 corporation 1 23.50 23.09



1" Mueller #1500 corporation
3/4 curb stop (flare)

3/4 curb stop (compression)
1" curb stop (flare)

1" curb stop (compression)
3/4 K copper tubbing

1 K copper tubbing

8x1 2-bolt brass saddle
8x3/4 2-bolt brass saddie
6x1 2-bolt brass saddle
6x3/4 2-bolt brass saddle
8x12 full circle repair clamp
8x20 full circle repair clamp
6x12 full circle repair clamp
6x20 full circle repair clamp
6" Hymax Coupling

8" Hymax Coupling

1" swivel 90* bend

1" swivel 45* bend

3/4 swivel 90* bend

3/4 swivel 45* bend

1" compression coupling w/lock
3/4 compression coupling wilock

36.00
57.00
55.00
72.00
82.00
2.95
4.75
104.00
104.00
84.00
84.00
89.25
145.00
76.00
125.00
189.00
213.00
25.00
27.75
20.50
18.50
16.25
14.25

35.73
51.36
50.69
78.00
83.78
2.88
3.75
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
156.86
253.92
133.20
221.57
200.41
226.27
31.56
35.67
25.29
25.08
No Bid
No Bid



