RESOLUTION NO. 2017-91

WHEREAS, pursuant to provisions of the Local Public Contracts Law, N.J.S.A. 40A:11-
I et seq. Specifications and bid proposals were prepared and duly advertised by the Township of
Aberdeen for Department of Public Works Road Materials for Maintenance and Repairs; and

WHEREAS, bids were received by the Qualified Purchasing Agent for the aforesaid
project; and

WHEREAS Stavola Construction Materials Inc. of Tinton Falls, NJ was the lowest
responsive and responsible bidder for items 1-3 and 5A. Trap Rock Industries of Kingston, NJ
was the lowest responsive and responsible bidder for items 4-6 and 4A and 6A. There were no
bids submitted for items 7 and 7A.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Township Council of the Township
of Aberdeen that the Department of Public Works Road Materials for Maintenance and Repairs
Contract be awarded to Stavola Construction Materials Inc. of Tinton Falls for items 1-3 and 5A:
and Trap Rock Industries of Kingston for items 4-6 and 4A and 6A.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that this resolution is subject to the Township
Manager’s certification of availability of Township of Aberdeen funds.



FOR: Road Materials for Maintenance & Repair

TOWNSHIP OF ABERDEEN

SUMMARY OF BIDS

DATE: Thursday, August 31, 2017 @ 10:00 a.m.

Stavola Construction
Materials, Inc

Trap Rock
Industries

American Asphalt
Company, Inc.

175 Drift Road

P.O. Box 419

100 Main Street

W. Collingswood Heights,

Tinton Falls, NJ 07724 Kingston, NJ 08528 NJ 08059
Bid Bond yes ves yes
Non-Collusion Yes yes yes
Affirmative Action Yes ves yes
Bid Proposal Yes yes yes
Cert of Ownership Yes ves ves
MILEAGE *51 Miles @ .61=$31.11 47 Miles @ .61 = $28.67 96.4 Miles @ .61 = $58.80
12 Miles @ .61=$7.32 22 Miles @ .61 = $13.42
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Item | Description Quantity Unit Price Price with Miles | Unit Price | Price with Miles Unit Price Price with Miles

FABC (Mix No. 5)
Stone Mix
F.O.B. Plant

1200 Tons

$75.00 $98,784.00.00

$102,504.00

No Bid

Bituminous Stabilized
Base Course (Mix No. 1)
Stone F.O.B. Plant

600 Tons

875.00 $49.392.00.00

$70.00 £50.052.00

No Bid

Bituminous Concrete
Stockpile Cold Patch
F.O.B. Plant

150 Tons

$£140.00 $22,098.00

$160.90 $26.013.00

¥+ Broken Stone (Quarry
Blend)
F.O.B. Plant

1500 Tons

$11.00 $63,165.00*

$11.00 $58,505.00*

L

¥ Broken Stone {Coarse
Aggregate)
F.O.B. Plant

500 Tons

$14.50 $22,805.00%
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$21 835.00%

No Bid

2-1/27” Broken Stone
(Course Aggregate)
F.O.B. Plant

300 Tons

$15.00 $13,833.00%

$15.00 | $13,101.00*

No Bid

No Bid

Coarse Sand for Snow
and Ice Control
F.O.B. Plant

500 Tons

No Bid No Bid

No Bid

Mo Bid

MNo Bid

ALTERNATES-
DELIVERY
INCLUDED

Unit Price Extended Price

Unit Price Extended Price

Unit Price

Extended Price i

%" Broken Stone (Quarry
Blend F.O.B. Township
Maint. Yard

it

587560

b

Ly
fonel
-

$15.00 £22,560.00

e

No Bid

No Bid

¥ Broken Stone (Course
Aggregate} F.O.B.

Dy

$5,125.00

$20.0

w

$10.000.00

Ne-Bid

Township Maint, Yarc

Yard

340 Tons
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Course Sand for Snow &
ice Control F.O.B.
Township Maint. Yard

400 Tons

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid




