RESOLUTION NO. 2018-130

WHEREAS, pursuant to provisions of the Local Public Contracts Law, N.J.S.A. 40A:11-
1 et seq. Specifications and bid proposals were prepared and duly advertised by the Township of
Aberdeen for the Sale of Surplus and Obsolete Motor Vehicles, Etc.;

WHEREAS, bids were received by the Qualified Purchasing Agent on October 26, 2018
for sale; and

WHEREAS, A. Devino Inc. of Newark, NJ failed to submit the required form of
payment;

WHEREAS, Jersey One Auto of Jersey City, NJ was the highest bidder for 1999 GMC
Utility Tuck-3500 and the 1978 Case-580C Backhoe; Macrzaks Inc. of Metuchen, NJ was the
highest bidder for 2010 Dodge Charger; Mario Teixeira of Aberdeen, NJ was the highest bidder
for the 2001 Dodge Pickup; Midway Auto of Morganville, NJ was the highest bidder for the
1994 Bandit 250 Chipper and the Kohler Generator.

WHEREAS, there were no bids submitted for the 1968 ISK Open 16ft Boat;
WHEREAS, there were no bids submitted for the 1985 Bay Cabin 19ft Boat;

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Township Council of the Township
of Aberdeen that the contract for the Sale of Surplus and Obsolete Vehicles, Etc. be awarded as
follows: 1999 GMC Utility Truck-3500 and 1978 Case-580C Backhoe be awarded to Jersey One
Auto; the 2010 Dodge Charger be awarded to Marczaks Inc.; 2001 Dodge Pickup be awarded to
Mario Teixeira; 1994 Bandit 250 Chipper and the Kohler Generator be awarded to Midway
Auto.



TOWNSHIP OF ABERDEEN

FOR: 2018 Obsolete Vehicles, Etc.

SUMMARY OF BIDS

DATE: Friday, October 26,2018 @10a.m.

Jersey One Auto

Mario Texiera

Robert Zuppa

495 Tonnele Ave
Jersey City, NJ 07307

848 South Concourse
Keyport, NJ 07735

820 Ridge Road
Aberdeen, NJ 07747

(201)217-1100

(732)895-1668

(732)895-0246

Bid Bond Cashier’s Check

Cash $7700.00 $2125.00 Cash $80.00
Non-Collusion
Affirmative Action
Bid Proposal
Cert of Ownership
Description:
1.1999 GMC Utility Truck-3500 $441.00 No Bid No Bid
2.2001 Dodge Pickup $447.00 $2125.00 No Bid
3.2010 Dodge Charger $155.00 No Bid No Bid

Bid .0

4. 1978 Case-580C Backhoe $3781.00 N 000
5. 1994 Bandit 250 Chipper $2876.00 Mo End S40.00
6. Kohler Generator No Bid No Bid No Bid
7.1968 ISL Open 16ft Boat No Bid No Bid No Bid
8.1985 Bay Cabin 19ft Boat No Bid No Bid No Bid
TOTAL $7,700.00 $2125.00 $80.00




TOWNSHIP OF ABERDEEN

SUMMARY OF BIDS
FOR: 2018 Obsolete Vehicles, Etc. DATE: Friday, October 26, 2018 @10a.m.
Midway Auto Marzaks
456 Texas Road 247 Central Ave
Morganville, NJ 07751 Metuchen, NJ 08840
(732)591-1652 (732)548-3187
Bid Bond Cashier’s Check
$2876.00
Cashier’s Check
$3277.00
Cashier’s Check
$339.00 Cash $1600.00
Non-Collusion
Affirmative Action
Bid Proposal
Cert of Ownership
Description:
1.1999 GMC Utility Truck-3500 No Bid $210.00
2.2001 Dodge Pickup No Bid $110.00
3.2010 Dodge Charger No Bid $210.00
510.
4. 1978 Case-580C Backhoe $2876.00 $310.00
5. 1994 Bandit 250 Chipper $3277.00 $31.0.00
6. Kohler Generator $339.00 $50.00
7.1968 ISL Open 16ft Boat No Bid No Bid
No Bid
8.1985 Bay Cabin 19ft Boat NO Bid
TOTAL $6492.00 $1600.00




