RESOLUTION NO. 2019-114

WHEREAS, pursuant to provisions of the Local Public Contracts Law, N.J.S.A. 40A:11-
1 et seq. Specifications and bid proposals were prepared and duly advertised by the Township of
Aberdeen for Department of Public Works Materials for Maintenance and Repairs; and

WHEREAS, bids were received by the Qualified Purchasing Agent on August 22, 2019
for the aforesaid project; and

WHEREAS, Core & Main of Edison NJ was the lowest responsive and responsible
bidder for items 1-2, 10-15, 17-22, 24-32, 36, 41-42, 51-57, 63-72; Raritan Pipe & Supply Co.,
Inc. of Edison, NJ was the lowest responsive and responsible bidder for items 3-9, 23, 33-35, 37-
40, 43-50, 59-62, 73-74; Brent Material Company of Florham Park, NJ was the lowest
responsive and responsible bidder for items 16, 58;

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Township Council of the Township
of Aberdeen that the Department of Public Works Materials for Maintenance and Repairs
Contract be awarded to Core and Main of Edison, NJ for items 1-2, 10-15, 17-22, 24-32, 36,41-
42, 51-57, 63-72; Raritan Pipe & Supply Co., Inc. of Edison, NJ for items 3-9, 23, 33-35, 37-40,
43-50, 59-62, 73-74; and Brent Material Company of Florham Park, N7 for items 16, 58

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED the Director of Finance has certified to the Township
Manager that there are available sufficient funds for the purpose of award of this contract in the
2019 Municipal Budget under the following line item appropriation of said budget to which this
contract will be properly charged: 9-02-1- 102-209, 9-02-1 102-211, 9-02-1 -102-214.



TOWNSHIP OF ABERDEEN
SUMMARY OF BIDS

FOR: Water Materials for Maintenance & Repair DATE:Thursday, August 22, 2019 @ 11:00am

Core & Main
61 Gross Avenue
Edison, NJ 08837

Bid Bond Yes

Non-Collusion Yes

Affirmative Action Yes

Bid Proposal Yes

Cert of Ownership Yes

EMN DESCRIPTION QUANITY UNIT PRICE TOTAL

1 6" CLDI pipe 18 LF $14.50 $290.00
2 8" CLDI pipe 18 LF $20.50 $410.00
3 6" Mueller 2360 gate valve 1 $644.00
4 8" Mueller 2360 gate valve 1 $1,000.00
5 5'bury Mueller SC250 fire hydrar 1 $2,625.00
6 4.5 bury MSC250 fire hydrant 1 $2,600.00
7 4'bury Mueller SC250 fire hydrar 1 $2,575.00
8 5 1/4 Mueller A-301 Break-away 1 $200.00
9 4 1/2 Mueller A-300 Break-away 1 $200.00
10 8x6 MJ hyrant tee 1 $200.00
11 8" MJ tee 1 $210.00
12 8" solid sleeve 1 $112.00
13 8" MJ 90* bend 1 $144.00
14 8" MJ 45* bend 1 $114.00
15 8"MJ 22.5* bend 1 $113.00
16 8" Mega lug & kit 1 $49.00
17 6x6 MJ hydrant tee 1 $164.00
18 6" hydrant tee 1 $142.00
19 6" MJ solid sleeve 1 $86.00
20 6"MJ 90* bend 1 $98.00
21 6"MJ 45* bend 1 $81.00
22 6"MJ 22.5* bend 1 $73.75
23 6" Mega lug & kit 1 $36.00
24 5/8" Sensus TRPL water meter 1 $140.00
25 5/8x3/4 Sensus TRPL water mett 1 $140.00
26 1" Sensus water meter 1 $500.00
27 2" Sensus water meter 1 $700.00
28 3" Sensus water meter 1 $1,750.00



4" Sensus water meter

6" Sensus water meter

Sensus AMI transmitter

Sensus TRPL pigtail

4' 2PC road box w/cover

1" road box riser

2" road box riser

3" road box riser

4" road box riser

4" Mueller H-10314 curb box

18" Mueller H10816 meter pit cvr
20" Mueller H10816 meter pit cvr
18x36 Mueller S1836 meter pit
20x36 Mueller S2036 meter pit
18"x36" Mueller EZ setter with lid
20"x36" Mueller EZ setter with lid
5/8 McD #37 meter setter
5/8x3/4 McD #37 meter setter

1" McD #37 meter setter

5/8 McD #30 meter setter
5/8x3/4 McD #30 meter setter

1" McD #30 meter setter

3/4 Mueller #1500 corporation

1" Mueller #1500 corporation
3/4 curb stop (flare)

3/4 curb stop (compression)

1" curb stop (flare)

1" curb stop (compression)

3/4 K copper tubbing

1 K copper tubbing

8x1 2-bolt brass saddle

8x3/4 2-bolt brass saddle

6x1 2-bolt brass saddle

6x3/4 2-bolt brass saddle

8x12 full circle repair clamp
8x20 full circle repair clamp
6x12 full circle repair clamp
6x20 full circle repair clamp

6" Hymax Coupling

8" Hymax Coupling

1" swivel 90* bend

1" swivel 45* bend

3/4 swivel 90* bend

3/4 swivel 45* bend

1" compression coupling w/lock
3/4 compression coupling w/lock

TOTAL
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$3,000.00
$5,100.00
$145.00
$0.27
$130.00
$11.00
$14.50
$22.00
$29.00
$44.00
$72.50
$88.00
$92.00
$105.00
NO BID
NO BID
$112.00
$112.00
$244.00
$122.75
$122.75
$225.00
$26.00
$40.00
$57.00
$56.00
$80.00
$85.00
$3.35
$4.25
$114.00
$114.00
$91.50
$91.50
$97.50
$160.00
$84.00
$135.00
$192.00
$217.00
$34.00
$29.50
$24.00
$20.00
$19.00
$17.00

$26,315.12

$700.00



TOWNSHIP OF ABERDEEN
SUMMARY OF BIDS

FOR: Water Materials for Maintenance & Repair DATE:Thursday, Au

Brent Material Company
325 Columbia Turnpike, suite 308
Florham Park, NJ 07932

Bid Bond Yes
Non-Collusion Yes
Affirmative Action Yes
Bid Proposal Yes
Cert of Ownership Yes
M N DESCRIPTION QUANITY UNIT PRICE TOTAL
1 6" CLDI pipe 18 LF $14.75 $265.50
2 8" CLDI pipe 18 LF $21.00 $378.00
3 6" Mueller 2360 gate valve 1 $591.00
4 8" Mueller 2360 gate valve 1 $941.00
5 5'bury Mueller SC250 fire hydran 1 $2,495.00
6 4.5 bury MSC250 fire hydrant 1 $2,425.00
7 4'bury Mueller SC250 fire hydran 1 $2,375.00
8 5 1/4 Mueller A-301 Break-away | 1 $180.00
-9 4 1/2 Mueller A-300 Break-away | 1 $180.00
10 8x6 MJ hyrant tee 1 $211.47
11 8" MJ tee 1 $218.79
12 8" solid sleeve 1 $116.38
13 8" MJ 90* bend 1 $148.96
14 8" MJ 45* bend 1 $119.05
15 8" MJ 22.5* bend 1 $116.38
16 8" Mega lug & kit 1 $44.00
17 6x6 MJ hydrant tee 1 $169.58
18 6" hydrant tee 1 $146.97
19 6" MJ solid sleeve 1 $89.11
20 6" MJ 90* bend 1 $101.75
21 6" MJ 45* bend 1 $83.79
22 6" MJ 22.5* bend 1 $76.48
23 6" Mega lug & kit 1 $34.00
24 5/8" Sensus TRPL water meter 1 NO BID
25 5/8x3/4 Sensus TRPL water mete 1 NO BID
26 1" Sensus water meter 1 NO BID
27 2" Sensus water meter 1 NO BID
28 3" Sensus water meter 1 NO BID
29 4" Sensus water meter 1 NO BID
30 6" Sensus water meter 1 NO BID
31 Sensus AMI transmitter 1 NO BID



32
33
34
35
36
37
38
39
40
41
42
43
44
45
46
47
48
49
50
51
52
53
54
55
56
57
58
59
60
61
62
63
64
65
66
67
68
69
70
71
72
73
74

Sensus TRPL pigtail

4' 2PC road box w/cover

1" road box riser

2" road box riser

3" road box riser

4" road box riser

4' Mueller H-10314 curb box

18" Mueller H10816 meter pit cvr.
20" Mueller H10816 meter pit cvr.

18x36 Mueller S1836 meter pit
20x36 Mueller S2036 meter pit
18"x36" Mueller EZ setter with lid
20"x36" Mueller EZ setter with lid
5/8 McD #37 meter setter
5/8x3/4 McD #37 meter setter
1" McD #37 meter setter

5/8 McD #30 meter setter
5/8x3/4 McD #30 meter setter
1" McD #30 meter setter

3/4 Mueller #1500 corporation
1" Mueller #1500 corporation
3/4 curb stop (flare)

3/4 curb stop (compression)

1" curb stop (flare)

1" curb stop (compression)

3/4 K copper tubbing

1 K copper tubbing

8x1 2-bolt brass saddle

8x3/4 2-bolt brass saddle

6x1 2-bolt brass saddle

6x3/4 2-bolt brass saddle

8x12 full circle repair clamp
8x20 full circle repair clamp
6x12 full circle repair clamp
6x20 full circle repair clamp

6" Hymax Coupling

8" Hymax Coupling

1" swivel 90* bend

1" swivel 45* bend

3/4 swivel 90* bend

3/4 swivel 45* bend

1" compression coupling w/lock
3/4 compression coupling w/lock

TOTAL
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NO BID
$135.00
$11.15
$14.50
$23.00
$29.50
$42.00
$70.00
$95.00
$108.00
$150.00
$600.00
$975.00
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
$29.00
$44.00
$65.00
$64.00
$98.00
$105.00
$3.40
$3.90
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
$210.00
$240.00
$37.00
$42.00
$30.00
$30.00
$20.00
$19.00

$14,192.91

$643.50



TOWNSHIP OF ABERDEEN

SUMMARY OF BIDS

FOR: Water Materials for Maintenance & Repair

DATE:Thursday, August 22, 2019 @ 11:00am

Raritan Pipe & Supply Company
301 Meadow Road
Edison, NJ 08817

Bid Bond Yes

Non-Collusion Yes

Affirmative Action Yes

Bid Proposal Yes

Cert of Ownership Yes

EMN DESCRIPTION QUANITY UNIT PRICE TOTAL

1 6" CLDI pipe 18 LF $15.22 $205.92
2 8" CLDI pipe 18 LF $21.54 $432.95
3 6" Mueller 2360 gate valve 1 $579.03
4 8" Mueller 2360 gate valve 1 $922.20
5 5'bury Mueller SC250 fire hydran 1 $2,416.15
6 4.5 bury MSC250 fire hydrant 1 $2,362.51
7 4'bury Mueller SC250 fire hydran 1 $2,308.99
8 5 1/4 Mueller A-301 Break-away | 1 $174.04
9 4 1/2 Mueller A-300 Break-away | 1 $174.04
10 8x6 MJ hyrant tee 1 $207.54
11 8"MJ tee 1 $214.72
12 8" solid sleeve 1 $114.22
13 8"MJ 90* bend 1 $146.19
14 8" MJ 45* bend 1 $116.83
15 8"MJ 22.5* bend 1 $114.22
16 8" Mega lug & kit 1 $44.42
17 6x6 MJ hydrant tee 1 $166.43
18 6" hydrant tee 1 $144.24
19 6" MJ solid sleeve 1 $87.46
20 6" MJ 90* bend 1 $99.86
21 6" MJ 45* bend 1 $82.24
22 6"MJ 22.5* bend 1 $75.06
23 6" Mega lug & kit 1 $32.73
24 5/8" Sensus TRPL water meter 1 NO BID
25 5/8x3/4 Sensus TRPL water mete 1 NO BID
26 1" Sensus water meter 1 NO BID
27 2" Sensus water meter 1 NO BID
28 3" Sensus water meter 1 NO BID



4" Sensus water meter

6" Sensus water meter
Sensus AMI transmitter
Sensus TRPL pigtail

4' 2PC road box w/cover

1" road box riser

2" road box riser

3" road box riser

4" road box riser

4' Mueller H-10314 curb box

18" Mueller H10816 meter pit cvr.
20" Mueller H10816 meter pit cvr.

18x36 Mueller S1836 meter pit
20x36 Mueller S2036 meter pit
18"x36" Mueller EZ setter with lid
20"x36" Mueller EZ setter with lid
5/8 McD #37 meter setter
5/8x3/4 McD #37 meter setter
1" McD #37 meter setter

5/8 McD #30 meter setter
5/8x3/4 McD #30 meter setter
1" McD #30 meter setter

3/4 Mueller #1500 corporation
1" Mueller #1500 corporation
3/4 curb stop (flare)

3/4 curb stop (compression)

1" curb stop (flare)

1" curb stop (compression)

3/4 K copper tubbing

1 K copper tubbing

8x1 2-bolt brass saddle

8x3/4 2-bolt brass saddle

6x1 2-bolt brass saddle

6x3/4 2-bolt brass saddle

8x12 full circle repair clamp
8x20 full circle repair clamp
6x12 full circle repair clamp
6x20 full circle repair clamp

6" Hymax Coupling

8" Hymax Coupling

1" swivel 90* bend

1" swivel 45* bend

3/4 swivel 90* bend

3/4 swivel 45* bend

1" compression coupling w/lock
3/4 compression coupling w/lock

TOTAL
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NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
$128.71
$10.94
$14.07
$22.18
$26.61
$37.66
$54.13
$83.36
$104.95
$143.90
$472.13
$842.65
$90.33
$97.08
$162.15
$93.97
$95.24
$159.52
$28.15
$42.97
$62.61
$61.80
$95.12
$102.15
$355.00
$462.00
$79.83
$79.83
$62.65
$62.65
$127.66
$212.92
$109.55
$189.47
$199.75
$225.53
$34.44
$38.92
$27.59
$27.37
$18.41
$16.87

$15,982.70

$638.87



